

**Current Sheriff Sales**

Date of Sale		Case #	Parcel #	Address
Apr. 4, 2014	12TF050217	6600269000	11 Prostpect St.	
Mt. Vernon, Ohio	MIN BID			
\$8,200		<b>DISMISSED</b>		
Apr. 4, 2014	13TF070293	4200746000	5321 Johnstown Rd.	
Mt. Vernon, Ohio	MIN BID			
\$6,600	Mark McMahon			
\$15,500				
Apr. 4, 2014	13TF110449	6300344000	202 Market St.	
Danville, Ohio	MIN BID			
\$6,400		<b>D</b>	<b>ISMISSED</b>	
Apr. 4, 2014	13TF020059	5400124000	14323 Becky Lane	
Mt. Vernon, Ohio	MIN BID			
\$11,900		<b>DISMISSED</b>		
Apr. 4, 2014	12TF050221	3200589000	Lt. 589 Highland Hills Se	
Howard, Ohio	<b>MIN BID</b>			
<b>\$5,500</b>				
	<b>NO BID/NO SALE</b>			
Apr. 4, 2014	13TF120476	6604452000		
6604453000	17 Sycamore St.			
Mt. Vernon, Ohio	MIN BID			
\$7,100		<b>D</b>	<b>ISMISSED</b>	
Apr. 4, 2014	13TF070295	4100443000	18245 Waterford Rd.	
Fredericktown, Ohio	MIN BID			
\$6,800		<b>NO BID/NO SALE</b>		
Apr. 4, 2014	13TF090369	5900229000		
5900230000				
5900587000	17815 Murray Rd.			
Mt. Vernon, Ohio	MIN BID			
\$20,000		<b>DIMISSED</b>		
Apr. 4, 2014	13TF110445	6606597000		
6606598000	11 Oberlin St.			
Mt. Vernon, Ohio	MIN BID			
\$7,500	Dominic Centofanti			

**Current Sheriff Sales**

\$7,500	Apr. 4, 2014	13TF100397	2900291000	Lt 291 North Ridge Hgts
Howard, Ohio		MIN BID		
\$4,500		Gary Schworm		
\$4,500	Apr. 4, 2014	09TF120722	1200057000	Lt 127 Fairview Addition
Mt. Vernon, Ohio		MIN BID		
\$7,800		Garrett Robinson		
\$7,800	Apr. 4, 2014	12FR030147	6200208000	243 State St.
Brinkhaven, Ohio		\$10,000.00		<b>WITHDRAWN</b>
Apr. 4, 2014		13FR080358	4300093006	10070 Butcher Rd.
Mt. Vernon, Ohio		\$65,000.00	Matthew Campbell	
\$57,000	Apr. 4, 2014	13FR010043	1200600000	
1200601000				
1202797000		201 Johnson Ave.		
Mt. Vernon, Ohio		\$65,000.00	Plaintiff/\$43,333	
Apr. 4, 2014		13FR110458	5800323001	18137 Carson Rd.
Butler, Ohio		\$150,000.00		<b>W</b> <b>ITHD</b>
Apr. 4, 2014		11FR060320	2600025000	1709 Apple Valley Dr.
Howard, Ohio		\$77,000.00	Plaintiff/\$85,219	
Apr. 4, 2014		13FR110434	6604444000	143 Mansfield Ave.
Mt. Vernon, Ohio		\$90,000.00	Plaintiff/\$60,000	
Apr. 4, 2014		13FR040191	2400311000	
2400312000		74 Malus Ct.		
Howard, Ohio		\$125,000.00		<b>WITHDRAWN</b>
Apr. 4, 2014		13FR100430	6606340000	405 Maplewood Ave.
Mt. Vernon, Ohio		\$43,000.00		<b>WITHDRAWN</b>
Apr. 4, 2014		12FR110574	0101368004	12900 Yankee St.
Bellville, Ohio		\$108,000.00	Plaintiff/\$73,910	
Apr. 4, 2014		11FR110617	6603626000	
6609133000				
6609134000		519 E. Chestnut St.		
Mt. Vernon, Ohio		\$108,000.00	Plaintiff/\$80,000	
Apr. 4, 2014		13FR120488	6500541000	90 W. College St.
Fredericktown, Ohio		\$79,000.00		<b>W</b> <b>ITHD</b>
Apr. 4, 2014		13FR030119	6000734001	28571 Mickley Rd.
Danville, Ohio		\$68,000.00		<b>WITHDRAWN</b>
Apr. 4, 2014		09FR050248	6604633000	118 E. Curtis St.

**Current Sheriff Sales**

Mt. Vernon, Ohio	\$65,000.00	Plaintiff/\$45,000	
Apr. 4, 2014	10FR120786	5900958000	17240 Murray Rd.
Mt. Vernon, Ohio	\$77,000.00		<b>WITHDRAWN</b>
Apr. 4, 2014	13FR100426	6501553000	20 Crestview Dr.
Fredericktown, Ohio	\$65,000.00	Plaintiff/\$43,333	
Apr. 4, 2014	12FR090451	6601440000	
6606494000			
6606498000	506 S. McKenzie St.		
Mt. Vernon, Ohio	\$106,000.00		<b>WITHDRAWN</b>
Apr. 4, 2014	13TF110441	6300342000	102 E. Main St.
Danville, Ohio	\$55,000.00	Plaintiff/\$36,667	
Apr. 4, 2014	13FR120506	6601173000	307 N. McKenzie St.
Mt. Vernon, Ohio	\$68,000.00	Plaintiff/\$52,700	
Apr. 4, 2014	13FR070315	6600436000	
6600435000	601 Newark Rd.		
Mt. Vernon, Ohio	\$72,000.00	Plaintiff/\$48,240	
Apr. 4, 2014	13FR050244	6601937000	300 E. Pleasant St.
Mt. Vernon, Ohio	<b>MIN. BID</b>		
\$30,120.00	Plaintiff/\$30,120		
Apr. 4, 2014	13FR060272	6609411000	308 Wooster Rd.
Mt. Vernon, Ohio	\$55,000.00	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
Apr. 4, 2014	13FR120497	0600575000	
0600576000	648 Terrace Ridge Dr.		
Howard, Ohio	\$85,000.00	Plaintiff/\$56,950	
Apr. 4, 2014	09FR090524	4700266000	20930 Schenck Creek R
Howard, Ohio	\$210,000.00	Plaintiff/\$261,034	
Apr. 4, 2014	12TF070350	1701105000	4941 Columbus Rd.
Centerburg, Ohio	\$40,000.00	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
May 16, 2014	10FR100651	1700392017	2080 Eckard Rd.
Centerburg, Ohio	\$179,000.00	<b>Vincent Swartzentruber</b>	
\$124,400			
May 16, 2014	14FR010017	3200045000	
3200046000	681 Highland Hills Dr.		
Howard, Ohio	\$270,000.00		<b>WITHDRAWN</b>
May 16, 2014	12FR080428	1800112000	26 S. Calhoun St.
Centerburg, Ohio	\$110,000.00		<b>WITHDRAWN</b>
May 16, 2014	13FR010042	6606104000	119 E. Pleasant St.
Mt. Vernon, Ohio	\$72,000.00	Plaintiff/\$48,000	
May 16, 2014	13FR040200	6000783000	28660 Black Rd.
Danville, Ohio	\$72,000.00		<b>W</b>
			<b>ITHD</b>
May 16, 2014	12FR070357	6604419000	

**Current Sheriff Sales**

6604420000	633 N. Sandusky St.			
Mt. Vernon, Ohio	\$59,000.00	Plaintiff/\$40,334		
May 16, 2014	13FR040191	2400311000		
2400312000	74 Malus Ct.			
Howard, Ohio	\$125,000.00	Plaintiff/\$90,000		
May 16, 2014	13FR100423	5100214010	1820 Debolt Rd.	
Utica, Ohio	\$97,000.00	Dominic Centofanti		
\$80,000				
May 16, 2014	14FR020064	2900560000	231 Glenridge Circle	
Howard, Ohio	\$126,000.00	Plaintiff/\$105,00		
May 16, 2014	13FR060270	5400071000	12721 Upper Frederickto	
Mt. Vernon, Ohio	\$80,000.00		<b>W</b>	<b>ITHD</b>
May 16, 2014	12FR080401	6600022000	110 E. Hamtramck St.	
Mt. Vernon, Ohio	\$65,000.00	Plaintiff/\$43,333.34		
May 16, 2014	13FR110463	6000032000	29495 Flat Run Rd.	
Danville, Ohio	\$95,000.00		<b>W</b>	<b>ITHD</b>
May 16, 2014	13FR100391	1701320005	1560 Porter Lane	
Centerburg, Ohio	\$108,000.00	Plaintiff/\$72,000		
May 16, 2014	14FR010020	3600163006	27671 Harris Rd.	
Frazeyburg, Ohio	\$50,000.00		<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
May 16, 2014	13FR030119	6000734001	28571 Mickley Rd.	
Danville, Ohio	\$68,000.00	Plaintiff/\$45,333		
May 16, 2014	12FR060319	3100125000	856 Royal Circle	
Howard, Ohio	\$114,000.00		<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
May 16, 2014	13FR120500	6603844000	19 Eastgate Dr.	
Mt. Vernon, Ohio	\$89,000.00		<b>W</b>	<b>ITHD</b>
May 16, 2014	13FR070310	3000291000		
3000292000	365 Valleybrook Circle			
Howard, Ohio	\$150,000.00	Plaintiff/\$100,000		
May 16, 2014	13FR070324	2700388000	724 Brooklawn Dr.	
Howard, Ohio	\$80,000.00		<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
May 16, 2014	14FR020050	6500704000		
17 Miami Ave.				
Fredericktown, Ohio				
\$89,000.00	Plaintiff/\$65,000			
May 16, 2014	13FR120485	6100192001		
6100192002				

**Current Sheriff Sales**

11119 Millersburg Rd.  
Danville, Ohio

\$132,000.00	Plaintiff/\$88,000		
May 16, 2014	13FR060272	6609411000	308 Wooster Rd.
Mt. Vernon, Ohio	\$55,000.00		<b>WITHDRAWN</b>

May 16, 2014	13FR070307	0300424000	
0300423000	23201 Ireland Rd.		
Howard, Ohio	\$79,000.00		<b>W</b> <b>ITHD</b>

May 16, 2014	13FR120502	6601769000	1054 Newark Rd.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$83,000.00	Plaintiff/\$58,235	
May 16, 2014	12FR050264	6609339000	107 S. Catherine St.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$70,000.00		<b>W</b> <b>ITHD</b>

July 11, 2014	13FR030123	5900869000	17129 Murray Rd.
Mt. Vernon, Ohio	\$45,000.00	No Bid/No Sale	
July 11, 2014	12FR100539	1800395000	249 S. Hartford Ave.
Centerburg, Ohio	\$130,000.00		<b>WITHDRAWN</b>

July 11, 2014	08FR100618	6500275000	
6500276000			

28 Zent Ave.  
Fredericktown, Ohio

\$40,000.00	Plaintiff/\$26,667		
July 11, 2014	14FR010025	5400217000	14666 Crooked St.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$102,000.00	Plaintiff/\$68,000	
July 11, 2014	13FR030128	2500281000	865 Terrace View Dr.
Howard, Ohio	\$140,000.00		
July 11, 2014	13FR050222	6602246000	609 W. Gambier St.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$70,000.00	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
July 11, 2014	12FR090451	6601440000	

6606494000			
6606498000	506 S. McKenzie St.		
Mt. Vernon, Ohio	\$106,000.00	Plaintiff/\$70,667	
July 11, 2014	14FR020069	6607627000	6 Monroe St.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$53,000.00	Plaintiff/\$35,333	
July 11, 2014	13FR060272	6609411000	308 Wooster Rd.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$55,000.00	Plaintiff/\$36,667	
July 11, 2014	10FR070426	1800289000	27 Landrum St.
Centerburg, Ohio	\$85,000.00		<b>W</b> <b>ITHD</b>

July 11, 2014	13FR080338	1201557000	740 Brookwood Rd.
---------------	------------	------------	-------------------

**Current Sheriff Sales**

Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$90,000.00	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
Aug. 22, 2014	14TF020043	2100086000	
2100087000	12449 Mary St.		
Howard, Ohio	MIN BID		
\$6,500	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>		
Aug. 22, 2014	14TF050154	3200195000	Lot 195 Highland Hills Se
Howard, Ohio	MIN BID		
\$5,900		<b>NO BID/NO SALE</b>	
<b>TO BE OFFERED AGAIN</b>			
<b>SEPT. 5, 2014</b>			
Aug. 22, 2014	14TF010001	0100738002	0 Ankenytown Rd.
Fredericktown, Ohio	MIN BID		
\$6,500.00	JMar Holdings LLC/\$13,500		
Aug. 22, 2014	12TF100506	1201522000	
1201523000	220 Crystal Ave.		
Mount Vernon, Ohio	MIN BID		
\$6,900.00	Choice Realty Solutions LLC/\$11,500		
Aug. 22, 2014	14TF030079	1300325000	20360 Zion Rd.
Howard, Ohio	MIN BID		
\$7,900		<b>DISMISSED</b>	
Aug. 22, 2014	13TF110443	2100147000	12346 East St.
Howard, Ohio	MIN BID		
\$9,000		<b>NO BID/NO SALE</b>	
<b>TO BE OFFERED AGAIN</b>			
<b>SEPT. 5, 2014</b>			
Aug. 22, 2014	10TF090543	2700291000	Lot 291 Country Club Ma
Howard, Ohio	MIN BID		
\$950.00	Bob Pack/\$950		
Aug. 22, 2014	13FR110462	1201940000	
1201941000			
1201942000	709 Broadway St.		
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$79,000.00	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
Aug. 22, 2014	14FR020053	1201019000	42 Columbus Rd.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$48,000.00	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
Aug. 22, 2014	13FR040200	6000783000	28660 Black Rd.
Danville, Ohio	\$72,000.00	Plaintiff/\$48,000	
Aug. 22, 2014	14FR040129	4901056000	17761 Scott Rd.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$50,000.00	<b>NO BID/NO SALE</b>	
Aug. 22, 2014	13FR070320	6607927000	407 E. Burgess St.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$82,000.00	Plaintiff/\$68,400	
Aug. 22, 2014	14FR020075	1200171000	7004 Kinney Rd.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$102,000.00	Plaintiff/\$85,000	
Aug. 22, 2014	13FR120483	6605964000	11 Cottage St.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$40,000.00	Plaintiff/\$81,935	
Aug. 22, 2014	13FR080359	6602064000	518 E. Hamtramck St.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$84,000.00	Matthew & Hannah Kelling	

**Current Sheriff Sales**

\$58,000			
Aug. 22, 2014	14FR040145	4700019000	12337 Vincent Rd.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$75,000.00	Thomas & Deborah Blanchard/\$55,000	
Aug. 22, 2014	14FR010033	1600507000	
1600507002			
1600507003	7677 Chadwick Rd.		
Gambier, Ohio	\$129,000.00	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
Aug. 22, 2014	13TF110451	6500044000	131 Salem Ave.
Fredericktown, Ohio	\$84,000.00	Plaintiff/\$56,000.00	
Aug. 22, 2014	14FR010032	4200406005	
4200406021	4938 Webster Rd.		
Centerburg, Ohio	\$212,000.00	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
Aug. 22, 2014	12TF070350	1701105000	4941 Columbus Rd.
Centerburg, Ohio	\$40,000.00	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
Aug. 22, 2014	14FR020056	4000041000	9524 Old Delaware Rd.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$108,000.00	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
Sept. 26, 2014	14FR060194	6601175000	2 Meltzer Court
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$68,000.00	Plaintiff/\$45,334	
Sept. 26, 2014	12FR030147	6200208000	243 State St.
Brinkhaven, Ohio	\$10,000.00	Plaintiff/\$6,667	
Sept. 26, 2014	14FR050170	1200022000	14 Northview Dr.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$62,000.00	Plaintiff/\$41,333	
Sept. 26, 2014	13FR100404	4200159000	2489 Johnstown Rd.
Centerburg, Ohio	\$160,000.00	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
Sept. 26, 2014	14FR050160	0100723000	18633 Love Rd.
Fredericktown, Ohio	\$75,000.00	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
Sept. 26, 2014	14FR050183	6604966000	335 Wooster Rd.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$110,000.00	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
Sept. 26, 2014	13FR030128	2500281000	865 Terrace View Dr.
Howard, Ohio	\$140,000.00	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
Sept. 26, 2014	11FR120641	6400600002	10190 Green Valley Rd.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$180,000.00	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
Sept. 26, 2014	13FR120490	2500177000	317 Apple Hill South
Howard, Ohio	\$80,000.00	Plaintiff/\$55,000	
Sept. 26, 2014	14FR020062	3200591000	816 Highland Hills Dr.
Howard, Ohio	\$114,000.00	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
Sept. 26, 2014	14FR060200	6603774000	12 Northgate Dr.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$82,000.00	Plaintiff/\$65,000	
Sept. 26, 2014	14FR030118	2200481000	622 Winesap Circle
Howard, Ohio	\$85,000.00	Plaintiff/\$60,000	
Sept. 26, 2014	14FR060193	6500075000	87 High St.
Fredericktown, Ohio	\$54,000.00	Plaintiff/\$60,800	
Sept. 26, 2014	11FR060333	6601946000	

**Current Sheriff Sales**

6601945000	1215 N. Mulberry St.		
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$83,000.00	Plaintiff/\$70,000	
Sept. 26, 2014	12FR060319	3100125000	856 Royal Circle
Howard, Ohio	\$114,000.00		<b>WITHDRAWN</b>
Sept. 26, 2014	14FR050159	6600868000	20 Martinsburg Rd.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$72,000.00	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
Sept. 26, 2014	05FR040173	0101252000	11479 Armentrout Rd.
Fredericktown, Ohio	\$80,000.00	Plaintiff/\$70,000	
Sept. 26, 2014			
14FR030113			
1000156001	3684 Martinsburg Rd.		
Gambier, Ohio	\$50,000.00	Plaintiff/\$33,333	
Sept. 26, 2014	12FR090471	6602691000	5 Marcia Dr.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$85,000.00	TSD Properties LLC	
\$58,000			
Sept. 26, 2014	14FR020061	1200103000	
1200104000	504 Belvedere Dr.		
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$50,000.00	Plaintiff/\$103,521	
Oct. 24, 2014	14TF060187	5900920002	.083 acres adjacent to
8169 Martinsburg Rd.			
Mount Vernon, Ohio	<b>MIN. BID</b>		
\$3,600.00	David & Lillie Kirkman		
\$3,600.00			
Oct. 24, 2014	12FR070352	6900136000	2345 Apple Valley Dr.
Howard, Ohio	\$125,000.00	Plaintiff/\$83,334	
Oct. 24, 2014	13FR030123	5900869000	17129 Murray Rd.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	<b>MIN.</b>	BID	
\$19,129.83	CRP Rentals LLC		
\$33,000			
Oct. 24, 2014	10FR030179	5400709000	12802 Old Mansfield Rd.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$87,000.00	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
Oct. 24, 2014	13FR100462	1201940000	
1201941000			
1201942000	709 Broadway St.		
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$75,000.00	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
Oct. 24, 2014	14FR010017	3200045000	
3200046000	681 Highland Hills Dr.		
Howard, Ohio	\$270,000.00	Tina & Karl Guegold	
\$182,000			
Oct. 24, 2014	14FR060215	6602881000	905 W. Burgess St.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$30,000.00	Plaintiff/\$20,000	



**Current Sheriff Sales**

Oct. 24, 2014	14FR040132	6609929001	1623 Old Delaware Rd.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$72,000.00	Plaintiff/\$48,000	
Oct. 24, 2014	14FR050182	6606475000	724 E. Vine St.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$59,000.00	PJ & DJ Properties LLC	
\$48,000			
Oct. 24, 2014	14FR040129	4901056000	17761 Scott Rd.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	<b>MIN. BID</b>		
\$28,000.00	Plaintiff/\$28,000		
Oct. 24, 2014	13FR100430	6606340000	405 Maplewood Ave.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$43,000.00	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
Oct. 24, 2014	14FR070226	3900453000	8590 Fairview Rd.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$140,000.00	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
Oct. 24, 2014	14FR070227	3900453003	8574 Fairview Rd.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$59,000.00	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
Oct. 24, 2014	12FR110573	1700622000	4661 Gilbert Rd.
Centerburg, Ohio	\$110,000.00	Lauren Grizzle	
\$89,500			
Oct. 24, 2014	13FR060275	6604635000	918 N. Mulberry St.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$58,000.00	Plaintiff/\$28,667	
Oct. 24, 2014	14FR040137	5900269000	16871 Murray Rd.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$135,000.00	Plaintiff/\$90,000	
Oct. 24, 2014	11FR030150	5902298002	17640 Hopewell Rd.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$150,000.00	Plaintiff/\$111,000	
Oct. 24, 2014	11FR120641	6400600002	10190 Green Valley Rd.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$180,000.00	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
Oct. 24, 2014	14FR010036	5100467001	
5100159000			
5100465000	1220 Millersburg Rd.		
Utica, Ohio	\$110,000.00	Plaintiff/\$102,343	
Oct. 24, 2014	14FR040143	2300469000	
2300470000	204 Hasbrouck Circle		
Howard, Ohio	\$140,000.00		<b>WITHDRAWN</b>
Oct. 24, 2014	14FR060217	5900575003	6400 Newark Rd.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$350,000.00	Plaintiff/\$233,333	
Oct. 24, 2014	14FR050180	6602253000	404 N. Gay St.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$78,000.00	Plaintiff/\$52,000	
Oct. 24, 2014	14FR060203	0300341000	16125 Skyline Dr.
Danville, Ohio	\$85,000.00	Plaintiff/\$56,667	
Oct. 24, 2014	14FR040150	2300331000	
2300332000	62 Orchard Hills Ct.		
Howard, Ohio	\$80,000.00	Matthew Kelling	
\$53,333			

**Current Sheriff Sales**

Oct. 24, 2014	14FR030095	3200440000	414 Highland Hills Circle
Howard, Ohio	\$140,000.00	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
Oct. 24, 2014	12TF070350	1701105000	4941 Columbus Rd.
Centerburg, Ohio	\$40,000.00	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
Oct. 24, 2014	13FR080338	1201557000	740 Brookwood Rd.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$88,000.00	Tyler & Michelle Brown	
\$65,000			
Nov. 21, 2014	14FR030093	4000079004	11352 Cochran Rd.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$250,000.00	Plaintiff/\$166,667	
Nov. 21, 2014	12FR100539	1800395000	249 S. Hartford Ave.
Centerburg, Ohio	\$130,000.00	Plaintiff/\$89,680	
Nov. 21, 2014	14FR080270	3600543008	27723 Front Royal Rd.
Walhonding, Ohio	\$85,000.00	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
Nov. 21, 2014	11FR010030	2200161000	140 Jonathon Dr.
Howard, Ohio	\$92,000.00	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
Nov. 21, 2014	13FR030128	2500281000	865 Terrace View Dr.
Howard, Ohio	\$140,000.00	Plaintiff/\$121,500	
Nov. 21, 2014	14FR020066	6609606000	3 N. Jefferson St.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$62,000.00	Plaintiff/\$41,333	
Nov. 21, 2014	13FR060270	5400071000	12721 Upper Fredericktown
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$80,000.00	Plaintiff/\$53,333	
Nov. 21, 2014	14FR050179	6604138000	900 Howard St.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$52,000.00	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
Nov. 21, 2014	13FR070324	2700388000	724 Brooklawn Dr.
Howard, Ohio	\$90,000.00	Plaintiff/\$60,000	
Nov. 21, 2014	13FR110469	1202323000	312 Seventh Ave.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$34,000.00	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
Nov. 21, 2014	11FR110609	6400550000	9480 Bryant Rd.
Fredericktown, Ohio	\$118,000.00	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
Nov. 21, 2014	14FR030112	6607897000	
6605827000	5 Marion St.		
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$63,000.00	Jason & Davinia Diehl	
\$42,000			
Nov. 21, 2014	14FR070246	6604047000	125 Mansfield Ave.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$85,000.00	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
Jan. 9, 2015	13fr110462	1201940000	
1201941000			
1201942000	709 Broadway St.		
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$75,000.00	Plaintiff/\$50,000	

**Current Sheriff Sales**

Jan. 9, 2015	14FR060197	2300300000	171 Crabapple Dr.
Howard, Ohio	\$157,000.00	John & Kari Ball	
\$116,000			
Jan. 9, 2015	10FR040244	2900211000	2636 Apple Valley Dr.
Howard, Ohio	\$79,000.00	Plaintiff/\$56,000	
Jan. 9, 2015	13FR070301	2800248000	167 Heatherwood Dr.
Howard, Ohio	\$59,000.00	Plaintiff/\$55,283	
Jan. 9, 2015	14FR070236	6604057000	
6609381000	403 S. Elm St.		
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$35,000.00	Plaintiff/\$23,333	
Jan. 9, 2015	14FR080271	6605009000	906 W. Chestnut St.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$40,000.00		<b>WITHDRAWN</b>
Jan. 9, 2015	14FR090291	0700170000	2783 Apple Valley Dr.
Howard, Ohio	\$80,000.00	Plaintiff/\$58,000	
Jan. 9, 2015	14FR040143	2300469000	
2300470000	204 Hasbrouck Circle		
Howard, Ohio	\$142,000.00	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
Jan. 9, 2015	14FR030117	1200623000	206 S. Norton St.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$48,000.00	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
Jan. 9, 2015	14FR070252	6300087000	8 E. Ross St.
Danville, Ohio	\$89,000.00	Plaintiff/\$59,333	
Jan. 9, 2015	14FR070239	0100836000	12209 Armentrout Rd.
Fredericktown, Ohio	\$45,000.00	Plaintiff/\$30,000	
Jan. 9, 2015	13FR070307	0300424000	
0300423000	20015 Wooster Rd.		
Howard, Ohio	\$79,000.00	<b>WITHDRAWN</b>	
Jan. 9, 2015	14FR090294	3600102000	30253 Jug Run Rd.
Frazeysburg, Ohio	\$162,000.00	Plaintiff/\$108,000	
Jan. 9, 2015	12FR120597	5700053006	20161 Wineland Rd.
Butler, Ohio 44822	\$125,000.00	Plaintiff/\$90,000	
Feb. 20, 2015	14FR080270	3600543008	27723 Front Royal Rd.
Walhonding, Ohio	\$87,000.00		
Feb. 20, 2015	14FR100332	4200103000	
4200183000			
4200841000	8177 Lock Rd.		
Centerburg, Ohio	\$120,000.00		
Feb. 20, 2015	14FR070226	3900453000	8590 Fairview Rd.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$140,000.00		
Feb. 20, 2015	14FR070227	3900453003	8574 Fairview Rd.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$59,000.00		
Feb. 20, 2015	14FR090300	6606559000	526 E. Gambier St.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$89,000.00		
Feb. 20, 2015	11FR050278	5900104004	

**Current Sheriff Sales**

---

5900104005	7534 Jacobs Rd.
Mount Vernon, Ohio	**\$650,000

**\*\*PER ORDER OF SALE THIS APPRAISAL IS BAS**

Feb. 20, 2015	12FR090478
Howard, Ohio	\$168,000.00

3200430000

431 Highland Hills Cir.

Feb. 20, 2015	14FR050179
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$52,000.00

6604138000

900 Howard St.

Feb. 20, 2015	14FR070249
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$63,000.00

6603799000

606 1/2 W. Gambier St.

Feb. 20, 2015	13FR110469
Mount Vernon, Ohio	\$34,000.00

1202323000

312 Seventh Ave.

Feb. 20, 2015	13FR070307
0300423000	20015 Wooster Rd.
Howard, Ohio	\$79,000.00

0300424000

Feb. 20, 2015	14TF030081
Centerburg, Ohio	\$130,000.00

1800436000

395 Michael St.

**WITHDRAWN**